
ICE BREAKER
If you could be any animal, which would you 
be and why? If you made a movie about your 
life, who would play you? What is your most 
embarrassing memory? 

GRATITUDE
What is one thing you are most grateful to 
have in your life this season? Who is one 
person you are grateful for in this season? 

THANKS
What is something kind that someone did for 
you this season? How has God blessed you 
and your family this season? 

TRADITION
What was your favorite holiday tradition as 
a kid? What is your favorite holiday tradition 
as an adult? What is your favorite part of 
Thanksgiving? What is your favorite Thanks-
giving dish? 

REFLECT
What is your favorite memory from 2018 so 
far? Think about your favorite Thanksgiving 
day, what made it special? 

Thanksgiving Day
TABLE TOPICS

DREAM
What is one thing you are hoping to accom-
plish before the end of the year? What is 
something you and your family are praying 
for in this season? 

SHARE
Share one scripture that is impacting your 
life in this season or has impacted your life in 
some way. 

CHALLENGE
What is most challenging for you in this sea-
son of life? Is there something you could use 
prayer and encouragement for? 

LAUGH
What is the silliest Christmas present you 
ever wished for? What is your funniest mem-
ory including someone else at the table? 
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